
ACT 10 OF 2005

THE KERALA FINANCE ACT, 2005

An Act to give effect to certain financial proposals of the Government of Kerala
for the year 2005-2006.

Preamble .—WH E R E A S it is expedient to  give effect to certain financial
proposals of the Government of Kerala for the Financial year 2005-2006;

BE it enacted in the Fifty-sixth Year of Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the Kerala
Finance Act, 2005.

(2) Sub-section (3A) of section 3 shall be deemed to have come into
force on the 17th day of February, 2005, Sub-section (12) of section 3 shall be
deemed to have come into force on the 25th day of November, 1988, sub-section
(14) of section 3 shall be deemed to have come into force on 28th day of May,
2002, sub-sections (2), (3), (4), (5) clause (a) of sub-section (9), (17) and (19) of
section 3 and section 7 shall come into force on the date of commencement of
the Kerala Value Added Tax Act, 2003 (30 of 2004) and the remaining provisions
shall come into force on the 1st day of April, 2005.

2. Amendment of Act  17 of  1959 .—In the Kerala Stamp Act, 1959
(17 of 1959),—

(1) section 30 A shall be omitted;

(2) in the Schedule,—

(a) in column (3) against serial number 21 for the entry “Two rupees
for every Rs.100 or part thereof of the fair value of the property or the amount
or value of the consideration for such conveyance, whichever is higher” the
entry “Six rupees for every Rs.100 or part thereof of the amount or value of the
consideration for such conveyance” shall be substituted ;
33/1070/2005/DTP.



2

(b) for serial number 22 and the entries relating thereto in columns
(2) and (3), the following serial number and entries shall, respectively, be
substituted, namely:—

 “22.  Conveyance  as  defined  by
section 2(d), not being a transfer
charged or exempted under
No. 55 of immovable property
situated within the Municipal
Corporations or Municipalities.

3.  Amendment of Act 15 of 1963.—In  the Kerala General Sales Tax Act,
1963 (15 of 1963),—

(1) in section 2,—

(i) for clause (xvB), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely:—

“(xvB) “Notified goods” means goods notified by the
Government for the purposes of section 30E.” ;

(ii) the proviso to clause (xxv) shall be omitted;

(iii) the Explanation under clause (xxvi) shall be omitted;

(iv) for clause (xxvii), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely: —

“(xxvii) “turnover” means the aggregate amount for which goods
are either bought or sold, supplied or distributed by a dealer,
either directly or through another, on his own account or on
account of others, whether for cash or for deferred payment or
other valuable consideration.” ;

(2) for section 5, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“5. Levy of tax on sale of goods.—(1) Every dealer (other than a
casual trader or agent of a non-resident dealer or the Central Government, or
Government of Kerala or the  Government of any other State or of any Union
Territory, or any local authority) whose total turnover for a year is not less than
two lakh rupees and every casual trader or agent of a non-resident dealer, the
Central Government, the  Government of Kerala, the  Government of any other
State or of any Union Territory or any local authority, whatever be its total

Eight rupees fifty paise for
every Rs. 100 or part thereof
of the amount or value of the
consideration for such
conveyance.”.



3

turnover for the year, shall pay tax on his taxable turnover for that year in
respect of goods included in the Schedule at the rate mentioned against such
goods,—

(a) in respect of Aviation turbine fuel, Diesel and Petrol, at the point of
sale in the State by an oil company liable to tax under this section,
except where the sale is by an oil company to another oil company
and at the point of first sale in the State by a dealer liable to tax
under this section when the sale is not by an oil company.

(b) in respect of Foreign liquor, at the point of sale by the Kerala State
Beverages (Manufacturing and Marketing) Corporation Limited and
at the point of first sale in the State by a dealer liable to tax under
this section except where the sale is to the Kerala State Beverages
(Manufacturing and Marketing) Corporation Limited.

(c) in respect of other goods included in the Schedule, at the point of
first sale in the State by a dealer liable to tax under this section.

Explanation : For the purposes of this section,—

(a) “Oil Company” means Kochi Refineries Ltd., Indian Oil
Corporation Ltd., Hindustan Petroleum Corporation Ltd., Indo-Burma Petroleum
Company Ltd., Bharat Petroleum and includes such other company as the
Government of Kerala may, by notification in the Gazette, specify in this behalf.

(b) “Foreign liquor” means and includes wine, brandy, champagne,
sherry, rum, gin, whisky, beer, cidar, cocoa brandy and all other distilled or
spirituous preparations but shall not include medicines and drugs covered by
the Kerala Value Added Tax Act, 2003 (30 of 2004).

(2) (i) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), every
dealer in Foreign Liquor, as specified hereunder, shall pay turnover tax on the
turnover of foreign liquor at all points of sale in the State, after making such
deductions as may be prescribed, namely:—

(a) by a bar attached  hotel, at the rate of ten per cent; and

(b) by others at the rate of five per cent,  on the turnover at all
points of sale.

Explanation I : Any distillery, brewery, winery or other manufactory
established under section 14 of the Abkari Act 1 of 1077, shall be liable to pay
turnover tax on the turnover including any duty of excise leviable on such liquor
at the hands of such person, whether such duty is paid by such person or any
subsequent dealer as per the provisions of section 18 of the said Act.



4

Explanation II : For the removal of doubt, it is hereby clarified that any
distillery in the State which sell liquor manufactured by it within the State to the
Kerala State Beverages (Manufacturing and Marketing) Corporation shall be liable
to pay turnover tax on the turnover of sale of liquor by it to the said
Corporation and the turnover for the purpose of this sub-section shall include
any duty of excise leviable on such liquor at the hands of such manufacturer
whether such duty is paid by the manufacturer or by the said Corporation.

Explanation III : For the purposes of this sub-section bar attached hotel
shall mean a hotel, restaurant, club or any other place which is licensed under
the Foreign Liquor Rules, to serve foreign liquor specified under clause (b) of
Explanation to sub-section (1).

(ii) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1) of section
22, no dealer shall collect from his purchaser the turnover tax payable by him
under this sub-section.

(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), every dealer
registered under sub-section (3) of section 7 of the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956
(Central Act 74 of 1956), shall, whatever be the quantum of his total turnover,
pay tax on his taxable turnover for that year in respect of the sale of the goods,
with reference to the purchase of which he has furnished a declaration under
sub-section (4) of section 8 of the said Central Act.

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1) but subject
to sub-section (5), where goods sold are contained in containers or are packed
in any packing materials, the rate of tax and the point of levy applicable to such
containers or packing materials, as the case may be, shall, whether the price of
the containers or the packing materials is charged separately or not be the same
as those applicable to goods contained or packed, and in determining the
turnover of the goods, the turnover in respect of the containers or packing
materials shall be included therein.

(5) Where the sale or purchase of goods contained in any containers
or packed in any packing materials is exempt from tax, then the sale or purchase
of such containers or packing materials shall also be exempt from tax.

Explanation : For the purposes of sub-section (4) and sub-section (5), the
word “containers” include gunny bags, tins, bottles or any other containers.” ;

(3) sections 5B and 5C shall be omitted;

(3A) section 5BA shall be omitted ;



5

(4) for section 5D, the following section shall be substituted,
namely: —

“5D. Levy of Additional Sales Tax.— The tax payable under section 5
and section 5A shall be increased by an additional sales tax at the rate of
fifteen per cent of the tax payable under the said sections:

Provided that no additional sales tax under this section shall be levied
on the tax payable on High Speed Diesel Oil, Petrol  falling under sub-entries (ii)
and (iv) of Sl. No.1 and  Foreign Liquor falling under Sl. No. 2 of the Schedule.”;

(4A) after section 5D, the following section shall be inserted, namely :—

“5E. Special provision for completion of  assessment of tax on lotteries.—
Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act or any judgement, decree or
order of any court, Tribunal or other authority, any dealer in lottery tickets liable
to pay tax under sub-section (1) of section 5 or section 5BA as it stood before
amendment by the Kerala Finance Act, 2005 shall be liable to pay tax on the
sale or purchase of lottery tickets at the rates applicable under this Act before
such amendment and nothing shall affect the right to initiate and complete any
proceedings pending regarding the assessment. Levy, collection and recovery
of tax, penalty or other amount chargeable including that of escaped turnover or
affect the liability of any person to pay any sum due from him or existing right
of refund under this Act or the right to initiate or continue any application,
appeal, revision including suomotu revision or other proceedings made or
preferred to any officer or authority under this Act.”;

(5) sections 7 and  9 shall be omitted;

(6) in section 17,—

(a) in sub-section (6) for the words ‘five years’ the words ‘four
years’ shall be substituted;

(b) after the fourth proviso to sub-section (6), the following proviso
shall be added, namely:—

“Provided also that the assessment relating  to the year 2000-01 shall
be completed on or before 31st March 2006.”;

 (c) in sub-section (8) in the last proviso, for the figures ‘2005’ the
figures ‘2006’ shall be substituted.”;



6

(7) after section 17A, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“17B. Special provision for completion of assessment .—
Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, a dealer who had purchased
any goods falling under serial numbers 12 to 32 of item (iv) of sub-clause 18 of
clause 3 of the Kerala Finance Bill, 2004 during the period from the first day of
April, 2004 to the 27th day of July, 2004, from any registered dealer after paying
tax at the rates shown in column (4) against the said serial numbers, such dealer
shall pay tax on the re-sale of such goods at the rates mentioned in column (6)
against such goods and the assessing authority shall complete the assessment
under section 17 of the Act.”;

(8) section 18 shall be omitted;

(9) in section 22,—

(a) the proviso to sub-section (3) shall be omitted;

(b) after sub-section (4), the following sub-sections shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(5) The Central Government, Government of Kerala, the Government
of any other State or any Union Territory (including departments of Central and
State Governments) and  local authorities shall collect tax at the rate or rates
specified in the Schedule to the Act in respect of any sale of goods effected by
them and the tax so collected shall be remitted to Government in the Commercial
Taxes Department on or before the 10th day of the succeeding month.

(6) If any officer responsible for collection of tax fails to do so or
fails to remit the tax  so collected under sub-section (5) such officer shall be
personally liable to Government for such amount together with interest and such
amounts shall be liable to be recovered from him as if it were arrears of  revenue
due on land recoverable from him.”;

(10) in section 23, for  sub-section (3) the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely :—

“(3) If the tax or any other amount assessed or due under this Act is
not paid by any dealer or any other person within the time prescribed therefore
in this Act or in any rule made thereunder and in other cases within the time
specified therefor  in the notice of demand, the dealer or the other person, shall
pay simple interest at the rate of twelve per cent per annum on the tax or other
amount defaulted.”;



7

(11) section 23A and  section 23B shall be omitted;

(12) in section 30B,   for  sub-section (4), the following sub-section shall
be substituted, namely:—

“(4) Where any person consigns any goods or transports any goods
liable to tax under this Act from another State into the State without any records
as provided for under sub-section (2) of section 29 or where the particulars
furnished in the documents accompanying the goods are false or the consignor
or purchaser stated therein is found to be bogus or non-existent or is not
traceable or where the transporter fails to prove the bonafides of the transport,
it shall be presumed that such goods have been sold in the State by the
consignor or the owner of the goods or the transporter or the owner or person
in charge of the vehicle or the person in charge of the goods or all of them
jointly and they shall be jointly and severally liable to pay tax on such
sales which shall be assessed and recovered in the manner provided for in
sub-section (3).” ;

(13) section 30 C and  section 30 D shall be omitted;

(14) in Section 30 E,—

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “coffee, rubber, cardamom,
ginger, pepper, arecanut, cashewnut, iron and steel and any other goods
notified by Government” , the words “any notified goods” shall be substituted;

(ii) In the second proviso to sub-section (4), for the word “penalty”
the words “redemption fee” shall be substituted;

(iii) for sub-sections (5) and (6), the following sub-sections shall be
substituted, namely:—

“(5) Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing provisions,
if the owner or person in charge of the notified goods or the owner or person
in charge of  the vehicle fails to prove the genuineness of the transport of the
notified goods or to remit the redemption fee  as specified in the second proviso
to sub-section (3), within thirty days from the date of seizure and detention of
goods and the authorized officer has reason to believe that the owner or the
person in charge of the vehicle or the driver has transported the notified goods
to evade payment of tax with the knowledge or connivance of the owner of the
goods, the officer may confiscate the vehicle or vessel along with the goods:

 Provided that the authorized officer shall serve notice to the owner
of the vehicle or the person in charge of the vehicle or the owner of the
notified goods, if ascertainable, intimating the  reason for the confiscation of the



8
vehicle or vessel affording him and an opportunity of being heard.   The officer
shall also afford an opportunity to any of such persons  to pay a penalty equal
to thrice the amount of tax attempted to be evaded in lieu of confiscation of the
notified  goods  and an amount equal to thrice the amount of such tax or
rupees one lakh whichever is higher in lieu of confiscation of the  vehicle or
vessel.

(6) No order confiscating any vehicle or vessel shall be made under
sub-section (4), if the owner or the person in charge of the vehicle or vessel
proves to the satisfaction of the authorized officer that it was used for carrying
the notified goods without the knowledge or connivance of the owner himself,
his agent, if any, or the person in charge of such vehicle or vessel and that each
of them has taken all reasonable and necessary precautions against such use.”;

(14A) after section 30F, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“30G. Police Assistance for inspection, search and seizure.—An officer
authorized under the provisions of this Act to conduct inspection, search or
seizure of any vehicle or vessel, goods, business place, residential
accommodation or any other place, if such officer feels necessary to have police
assistance for the effective conduct of such inspection, search or seizure may
seek police assistance from the officer in charge of the police station or from his
superior officer having jurisdiction over the area where inspection, search or
seizure is to be conducted or is being conducted and thereupon such police
officer shall render such assistance to the officer as may be required for the
conduct of such inspection, search or seizure.”;

(15) in section 32, after the words ‘or steamer agency’ and before the
words ‘in the State’ the words ‘or courier services’ shall be inserted;

(16) after section 49, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“49A. Bar against attachment in certain cases.—Notwithstanding
anything contained in any other law in force or in any judgment, decree or order
of any   court, no court or any other authority shall pass any order attaching
any amount    from any person  out of the tax collected by such person under
the Act and kept with him before it became due to Government.”;

(17) in Section 59,  after sub-section (3) the following sub-section shall
be inserted, namely:—

“(4). Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, goods which
were liable to tax at the point of last purchase in the State under section 5, on
the date preceding the date of coming into force of The Kerala Value Added Tax
Act, 2003 (30 of 2004) and purchased in the State and are held as closing stock
on such date shall be deemed to have acquired the quality of last purchase in
the State on such date, and tax levied at the rate of four per cent.”;



9

(18) in Section 59A, after sub-section (5), the following sub-section
shall be inserted, namely:—

“(6) The Commissioner may, on application or otherwise, at any time
within a period of three years from the date of the orders passed under
sub-section (1), rectify any error apparent on the face of the record :

Provided that no such rectification which is prejudicial to a person shall
be made, unless the Commissioner has given notice to the person affected and
has allowed him a reasonable opportunity of being heard.”;

(19) for the Schedules, the following Schedule shall be substituted,
namely:—

“THE SCHEDULE

[Section 5(1)]

Goods in respect of which tax is leviable under section 5

Rate of
  Sl. No. Sub-entry Description of goods tax

(per cent)

1. Petroleum products :

 (i) Aviation turbine fuel      34

(ii) High Speed Diesel Oil      40

  (iii) Motor Spirit (including light diesel oil but
excluding petrol, naphtha, aviation turbine
fuel and high speed diesel oil)      50

 (iv) Petrol other than naphtha      44

2. Foreign Liquor :

 (i) Beer and wine      60

 (ii) Other than Beer and Wine      90

3.  Ganja and Opium :      85. ”.



10
4. Amendment of Act 32 of 1976.—In the Kerala Tax On Luxuries Act,

1976  (32 of 1976),—

(1)  in section 2,—

(a) after clause (b), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(bb) ‘Appellate Tribunal’ means the Appellate Tribunal  appointed
under section 4 of the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 (15 of
1963);

(b) for clause (f),  the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(f) “Luxury provided in a hotel, house boat, hall, auditorium,
Kalyanamandapam or place of like nature” means accommodation
for residence or use and other amenities and services provided in a
hotel or house boat or hall or auditorium or kalyanamandapam or
place of like nature the rate of charges of which, exclusive of
charges for food, drink and telephone calls, is seventy-five rupees
per day or more.”;

(c) for clause (h), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(h) “proprietor” in relation to a hotel, house boat, hall, auditorium,
Kalyanamandapam or place of like nature includes the person who
for the time being is in charge of the management of such hotel,
house boat, hall, auditorium or kalyanamandapam or place of like
nature as the case may be.”;

(2) in section 4,—

(a) in sub-section (1) for the words “hotel or a house boat” the words
“hotel, house boat, hall, auditorium or kalyanamandapam or
including those attached to hotels, clubs,  kalyanamandapam and
places of the like nature  which, are rented for accommodation for
residence or  used for conducting functions, whether public or
private, exhibitions” shall be inserted;

(b) to sub-section (1),  the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely:—

“ Provided that the sub-section shall not apply to halls and
auditoriums located within the premises of ‘places of worship’
owned by such institutions.”

(c) in sub-section (2A),   for the words “four per cent” the words
“ten  per cent”  shall be substituted;



11
(d) after sub-section (2A) the following sub-section shall be inserted,

namely:—

“(2B) The luxury tax payable in respect of hall, auditorium,
Kalayanamandapam or place of the like nature under sub-section
(1) shall be at the following rates, of such charges received on all
amenities and services provided, but exclusive of charges for food,
drink and telephone calls, namely:—

Rent or other charges realized Rate of Tax

(1) Six  thousand  rupees and  above Ten per cent
But below twenty five thousand rupees

(2) Twenty Five thousand rupees  and Twenty per cent
above
But  below  fifty thousand rupees

(3) Fifty thousand rupees and above Thirty per cent”;

(3) for section 4 B, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“4B. Registration of Hotels etc.—(1) Every proprietor of a hotel having
not less than five rooms to be rented for accommodation for residence or
otherwise and of every house boat, hall,  auditorium, kalyanamandapam and
place of the like nature shall get his hotel, house boat, hall, auditorium,
kalyanamandapam or place of the like nature registered under the Act and the
registration renewed annually.”

(2) An application for registration or renewal shall be made to such
authority in such manner and within such period as may be prescribed and shall
be accompanied by a fee as specified below :

“(a) Star Hotels Six thousand two hundred and
fifty rupees

(b) Hotels other than Star Hotels,—

(i) Within the  local  area  of  a One thousand two  hundred
Municipal Corporation and fifty rupees

(ii) Within  the  local area  of  a
municipal council or township
by whatever name called One thousand rupees

(iii) Within  the  local area of  a
grama panchayath Seven hundred and fifty rupees



12
(c) Halls, Auditorium, Kalyanamandapams etc.,—

(i) Within  the  local  area  of  a
municipal corporation One thousand rupees

(ii)  Within  the  local  area of  a
Municipal council, or Township
by whatever name called Seven hundred and fifty rupees

(iii) Within  the  local  area  of  a
grama panchayath Five hundred rupees”;

(4) in section 5A, for clauses (a), (b) and (c) the following clauses
shall be substituted, namely:—

“(a) Within the local area of a Municipal Corporation;
(i) per air-conditioned room One  thousand  eight  hundred

and seventy five rupees
(ii) per non-air conditioned room One thousand two hundred and

fifty rupees
(b) Within the local area of a municipal council or township by whatever

name called;
(i) per air-conditioned room One  thousand  eight  hundred

and seventy-five rupees
(ii) Per non-air conditioned room One thousand rupees

(c) Within the local area of a panchayath;
(i) Per air conditioned room One thousand rupees
(ii) Per non-air conditioned room Seven hundred and fifty rupees”;

(5) after section 7, the following  section shall be inserted, namely:—

“7A. Appeal to Appellate Tribunal.—(1) Any person aggrieved by an
order referred in the sub section (1) of section 7 or any officer empowered by the
Government in this behalf or any other person objecting to an order passed by
the Appellate Authority under sub section (1) of section 7 may, within sixty
days from the date on which the order was served on him appeal against such
order to the Appellate Tribunal in such manner as may be prescribed:

Provided  that the Appellate Tribunal may admit an appeal presented after
the expiry of the said period if it is satisfied that the appellant has sufficient
cause for not presenting the appeal within the said period.

(2) Every appeal shall be in the prescribed form and shall be verified in
such manner as may be prescribed, and shall be accompanied by a fee of rupees
seven hundred.



13
(3) In disposing an appeal, the Appellate Tribunal may, after giving the

parties a reasonable opportunity of being heard, either in person or by  a
representative, in the case of an order of assessment or penalty,—

(i) confirm, reduce, enhance or annul the assessment or penalty or
both; or

(ii) set aside the assessment and direct the assessing authority to
make a fresh assessment after such enquiry as may be directed; or

(iii) pass such other orders as it may think fit :
Provided that if the appeal involves a question of law for which

the Appellate Tribunal has previously given its decision in another
appeal and the matter is pending for decision before the High
Court or the Supreme Court as the case may be, the Appellate
Tribunal may defer the hearing of the appeal before it, till the
matter is finally disposed of by the High Court or the Supreme
Court,  as the case may be:

(4) Every order passed by the Appellate Tribunal under sub section (3)
shall be communicated in the manner prescribed to the appellant,
the respondent, the authority from whose order the appeal was
preferred, the Deputy Commissioner concerned and to the
Commissioner Commercial Taxes.”;

(6) for section 10, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“ 10. Interest on Default.—If the tax or any other amount assessed or due
under this Act is not paid by the proprietor  or any dealer or any other person
within the time prescribed therefor, in this Act or in any rule made there under
and in other cases within the time specified therefor  in the notice of demand,
the proprietor or the other person shall pay simple interest at the rate of twelve
per cent per annum on the tax or other amount defaulted.”.

5. Amendment of Act 15 of 1991.—In the Kerala Agricultural Income Tax
Act, 1991  ( 15 of 1991),—

(1) in section 37,—

in sub-section (4), for the words ‘fifteen per cent’ the words ‘twelve
per cent’ shall be substituted;

(2) in section 39,—

in the first proviso, after the words ‘derived from’ and before the words
‘manufactured tea’ the words “rubber, coffee and” shall be inserted;

(3) after section 91 the following section shall be inserted, namely;



14

“ 91A. Appropriation of Payment.—(1) Where any tax or any other
amount due or demanded under the Act is paid by an assessee or other person,
the payment so made shall be appropriated first towards interest accrued on
such tax or other amount under sub section (4) of Section 37 on such date of
payment and the balance available shall be appropriated towards principal
outstanding, notwithstanding any request to the contrary by the assessee or
any person making such payment.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1) where any
assessee or other person has paid any amount towards tax or any other amount
prior to coming into force of this section, no re-computation of such payments
shall be made under sub-section (1)”;

(4) for the  Schedule   the following  Schedule shall be substituted, namely :—

“SCHEDULE

(See section 3)

RATES OF AGRICULTURAL INCOME TAX

(1) In the case of person other than a company or co-operative
society;

(a) Where the total agricultural income
does not exceed Rs. 40,000

(b) Where the total agricultural income
exceeds  Rs. 40,000  but  does
not exceeds Rs. 60,000

(c) Where the total agricultural income
exceeds Rs. 60,000 but does not
exceeds Rs. 1,00,000

(d) Where the total agricultural income
exceeds Rs. 1,00,000

(2) In the case of a firm, thirty five per cent of the total agricultural
income.

Nil

10  per cent  of  the
amount by which
the total  agricultural
income    exceeds
Rs. 40,000

Rs. 2000 plus 20
per cent of the amount
by which the total
agricultural income
exceeds Rs. 60,000

Rs. 10,000 plus 30
per cent of the amount
by which the total
agricultural income
exceeds Rs. 1,00,000



15

(3) In the case of a domestic company or co-operative society,—

(a) Where the total agricultural income
does not exceed Rs. 25,000

(b) Where the total agricultural income
exceeds Rs. 25,000 but does not
exceeds Rs. 1,00,000

(c) Where the total agricultural income
exceeds Rs. 1,00,000 but does not
exceeds Rs. 3,00,000

(d) Where the total agricultural income
exceeds Rs. 3,00,000

(4) In the case of foreign company, eighty per cent of the total
agricultural income.”.

6. Amendment of Act 15 of 1994 .—In   The Kerala Tax on Entry of
Goods into Local Areas Act, 1994 (15 of 1994),—

(1) in section 4, after the words, brackets and figures “ Kerala
General Sales Tax Act, 1963 (Act 15 of 1963)”, the words,
brackets and figures “or the Kerala Value Added Tax Act, 2003
(Act 30 of 2004)” shall be inserted ;

(2) in section 12, after the word ‘exempt’ the words ‘either
prospectively or retrospectively’ shall be inserted ;

(3) in section 14AA,  for the words and figures  “31st day of
December 2004”,  the words and figures “31st day of March
2006.” shall be substituted ;

(4) in section 15, sub-section (2) shall be omitted ;

(5) after section 15, the following section shall be inserted,
namely :—

“15A.  Interest on default .—If the tax or any other amount
assessed or due under this Act is not paid by any dealer or
any other person within the time prescribed therefor in this Act
or in any rule made thereunder and in other cases within the
time specified therefor  in the notice of demand, the dealer or
the other person shall pay, simple interest at the rate of twelve
per cent per annum on the tax or other amount
defaulted.” ;

35 per cent of the total
agricultural income
40 per cent of the total
agricultural income

45 per cent of the total
agricultural income

50 per cent of the total
agricultural income



16

(6) for section 18, the following section shall be substituted,
namely :—

“18. Restriction on Registration.—Notwithstanding anything contained in
any other law for the time being in force, where the liability to pay tax in
respect of a motor vehicle or body built on a motor vehicle arises under this
Act, and such motor vehicle  or body built on motor vehicle is required to be
registered in the State under the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 (Central Act 59 of
1988), no registering authority shall register such motor vehicle with body built
on motor vehicle, unless the person concerned furnishes a certificate of payment
of such taxes due under the Act, issued by the competent authority of the
Commercial Taxes Department.”;

(7) in the Schedule,—

(a) for the entries against serial number 2, the following entries
shall be substituted, namely :—

“ Cement including white cement” ;

(b) for the entries against serial number 6, the following entries
shall be substituted, namely :—

“ Cudappa stones, Kotta stones, any other similar stones
and slabs”;

(c) for the  entries against serial number 19,  the following
entries shall be substituted, namely :—

“ Generator—whether assembled or unassembled” ;

(d) after serial number 59 and the entries against it, the
following serial numbers and entries shall be added, namely :—

“60. Scientific and laboratory equipments.

61. Electronic goods.

62. Machineries.

63. Fire works including colored matches.

64. Glasses.

65. Motor vehicle spares.

66. Linoleum and flexible flooring materials.”.



17

7. Amendment of Act 30 of 2004 .—In the Kerala Value Added Tax
Act, 2003 (30 of 2004),—

 (1) in section 2,—

   (a) for clause (x), the following clause shall be substituted, namely :—

“(x) “capital goods” means plant, machinery, equipments including
pollution/quality control, lab and cold storage equipments used in manufacture,
processing, packing or storage of goods in the course of business but shall not
include such goods  and  civil structure as may be notified by Government.”

(b) after clause (xviii) the following clause shall be inserted,
namely :—

“(xviii A) “Empowered Committee” means the Empowered committee of
State Finance Ministers constituted by the Ministry of Finance, Government of
India on the basis of the resolution adopted in the conference of the Chief
Ministers on 16th November, 1999.”;

(ba) after clause (xxxvi) the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(xxxviA) Prevailing market price” means the sale price for the sale of
goods fixed by the assessing authority, if he has reason to believe that the
dealer has practiced undervaluation and the sale price shall be the value or price
at which the goods of the kind or quality are sold or capable of being sold in
the open market or the price obtained from the Kerala State Civil Supplies
Corporation Ltd. or Economic and Statistics Department of the State or other
reliable sources on the date or sale of such goods.”;

(bb) in clause (xlvi), for the word and figures, “section 49”, the word and
figures “section 46” shall be substituted.

 (c) after clause (lvi), the following clause shall be inserted,
namely :—

“(lvii) “zero rate sale” means the sale of any goods on which no tax
is chargeable but in relation to which input tax credit or refund of input tax paid
is admissible.”

(2) in section 6 ;

(a) in sub-section (1),—

(i) for the words “not less than two lakhs”, the words “not less
than ten lakhs” shall be substituted ;

(ii) for clause (a), for the words “Second, Third and Fifth
Schedules”, the words, “Second and Third Schedules” shall be substituted ;



18

(iii) for  clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely :—

“(b) goods specified in the Fourth Schedule shall be outside the
purview of this Act.”;

(iv) for clauses (d), (e) and (f), and the provisos and the
Explanation thereunder, the following clauses shall be substituted, namely :—

  “(d) in the case of goods not falling under clauses (a), (b) or (c),
at the rate of 12.5% at all points of sale of such goods within the State ;

(e) in the case of transfer of goods involved in the execution of
works contract where transfer is in the form of goods, at the rates specified for
such goods in clause (a), (b), (c) or (d) above, as the case may be;

(f) in the case of transfer of goods involved in the execution of
works contract, where the transfer is not in the form of goods but in some other
form, at the rate of 12.5% at all points of sale;” ;

(aa) in the proviso to the sub-section (2), for the words ‘two lakh
rupees’ the words’ five lakh rupees’ shall be substituted ;

(b) sub-section (3) and the provisos thereunder shall be omitted ;

(c) in sub-section (5), for the words “twenty lakhs” and “two per
cent of the turnover” the words “fifty lakhs” and “one per cent of the turnover
of taxable goods” shall be substituted.

 (d) after sub-section (5) the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely :—

“Provided that a dealer who has been paying tax under sub-section (1)
shall not be entitled to opt for payment of tax under this sub-section unless his
total turnover continue to be within the limit specified in this sub-section
consecutively for three years;”;

(3) in section 8,—

(a) for clause (a) the following clause shall be substituted,
namely :—

(a) (i) any works contractor who is not an importer or a dealer
effecting first taxable sale in the State may, at his option, instead of paying tax
in accordance with the provisions of the said sections,  pay tax at two per cent
of the whole contract amount.

(ii) any works contractor, other than those undertaking
electrical, refrigeration or air conditioning contracts or contracts relating to
supply and installation of plant, machinery, rolling shutters, cranes, hoists,
elevators (lifts), escalators, generators, generating sets, transformers, weighing



19

machines, air conditioners and air coolers, deep freezers, laying of all kinds of
tiles (except brick tiles), slabs and stones (including Marble), and not falling
under clause (i) above, may at his option, instead of paying tax in accordance
with the provisions of the said sections, pay tax at six per cent of the whole
contract amount.

(b) to clause (a), the following explanation shall be inserted,
namely :—

“ Explanation : “First taxable sale” for the purpose of this section shall
mean the sale of taxable goods effected  by a registered dealer immediately after
the import of such goods into the State or its manufacture in the State or after
its purchase from a person other than a registered dealer in the State, as the case
may be.” ;

(c) in clause (b), for the Explanation, the following Explanation shall
be substituted, namely :—

“ Explanation : For the purposes of this clause, primary crusher shall also
be reckoned for the purpose of computation of the quantum of compounded tax
and the rate applicable for primary crusher shall be fifty per cent of the rates
mentioned in items (i), (ii) and (iii) above.” ;

(d) for clauses (c) and (d), the following clauses shall be
substituted, namely :—

“(c) Any dealer in cooked food and beverages, including beverages
prepared by him, other than a dealer supplying cooked food or beverages to
any airline service company or institution or shipping company for serving in
air craft, ships or steamer or served in air craft, ship, steamer, bar attached hotel
or star hotel may, at his option, instead of paying tax in accordance with the
provisions of section 6, pay tax at one per cent of the taxable turnover.

Explanation : For the purposes of this clause “bar attached hotel” shall
mean a hotel or restaurant or club or any other place which is licensed under the
Foreign Liquor Rules to serve foreign liquor falling under Sl. No. 2 of the Fourth
Schedule.

(d) Any dealer who transfers the right to use Video Cassette or
Computer Disc may, instead of paying tax in accordance with the provisions of
section 6, pay tax at the rate of one thousand rupees per year for every main or
branch shop situated in any place within the limits of any Municipal Corporation
or Municipality and rupees five hundred per year for any main or branch shop
situated in any other place or places” ;

(4) for section 10 the following section shall be substituted, namely :—

“10. Deduction of tax at source.—(1) Every awarder shall deduct from
every payment, including advance payment,  made by him to any works
contractor liable to pay tax under section 6, in relation to any works contract



20

awarded, the tax payable by the contractor in respect of such contract under
that section, whether the transfer of goods involved in the execution of works
contract is in the form of goods or not, and remit it to Government, in the
prescribed manner, within five days from the date of such deduction.  Every
such awarder shall also file such return as may be prescribed.

(2) For the purposes of sub-section (1) the awarder shall obtain from
the contractor a declaration in the prescribed form, showing his tax liability in
relation to such works contract:

Provided that the awarder shall obtain from the contractor quarterly
certificate issued by the assessing authority showing the tax liability or tax
remittances, as the case may be, of the contractor in relation to the contract up
to the end of the previous quarter:

Provided further that the awarder shall, before making final payment to the
works contractor in respect of any contract, obtain a liability certificate from the
assessing authority.

(3) If any awarder effects any payment without deduction of the tax as
provided under sub-section (1) or after making such deductions, fails to remit
the same to Government within the time limit specified under the said sub-
section, the awarder and  any person or persons responsible for such deduction
on behalf of the awarder, including a Director, Manager, Secretary or other
officer of a company, shall be jointly and severally liable for payment of such
amounts to the Government forthwith as if it were a tax due from him.

Explanation : For the purposes of this section :

(1) “company” means any body corporate and includes a firm or other
association of individuals, or a Co-operative society; and

(2) “Director” in relation to a firm, means partner in the firm.” ;

(5) in section 11,—

 (a) for sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely :—

“(2) In respect of capital goods purchased by a dealer, input tax credit
shall be allowed over a period of three years from the date of commencement of
commercial production or from the date from which the capital goods are put to
use, whichever is later, in such manner and subject to such conditions as may be
prescribed.”;

(b) in sub-section (3), for the words “output tax paid by him”, the
words, “output tax payable by him” shall be substituted ;



21

(ba) After sub-section (3) the following provisos shall be inserted,
namely :—

“Provided that no input tax credit shall be allowed to any amount illegally
collected by way of tax as specified in sub-section (3) (a) of Section 30 of the
Act :

Provided also that where any goods purchased in the state are
subsequently sold at subsidized price, the input tax allowable under the sub-
section in respect of such goods shall not exceed the output tax payable on
such goods.”;

(c) in sub-section (5),—

a. In clause (g) the word “consumable” shall be omitted.
b. Clauses (h), (i) and (o) shall be omitted ;

(d) to sub-section (6), the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

“ Provided that where the excess input tax so carried forward cannot be
fully adjusted during the last return period of that year and the output tax for the
subsequent year is less than the excess input tax credit so remaining
unadjusted, the amount by which the output tax for the subsequent year falls
short of the excess input tax credit so remaining unadjusted, shall be refunded
to the dealer as if it were a refund accrued under section 13.” ;

(e) in sub-section (7), after the words “at the time of closure of
business” and before the words “in-put tax” the words “in relation to such
goods” shall be inserted ;

(f) after sub-section (12), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely :—

“(13) Subject to the provisions of sub-sections (4) to (7) and sub-
sections (9) to (12), input tax credit shall be allowed to a registered dealer in
respect of the tax paid under the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 (Act 15 of
1963), in respect of goods purchased by him during a period of one year
immediately preceding the date of commencement of this Act and held as
opening stock on such date and sold or used in the manufacture of taxable
goods or used in the execution of works contract or for use as containers or as
packing materials for the packing of taxable goods in the State for sale thereafter,
against the output tax payable by him, subject to such conditions and
restrictions as may be prescribed :

Provided that the assessing authority may adjust any amount accruing to a
dealer as input tax credit under this sub-section towards any tax or other amount
due from the dealer, under this Act or under the provisions of the Kerala General



22

Sales Tax Act, 1963 (15 of 1963) or the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 (Central Act
74 of 1956) or the Kerala Tax on Entry of Goods into Local Areas Act, 1994 (15
of 1994).

Explanation : For the purposes of this sub-section “input tax” means tax
paid by one registered dealer under the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 (15 of
1963) to another such dealer or, where the goods are liable to tax under the
Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 (15 of 1963) at the point of first purchase or
last purchase, as the case may be, the tax paid by the dealer claiming input tax
credit under this sub-section on the purchase.”.

(6). for section 12, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“12. Special rebating in certain cases.—In calculating the net tax payable
by a dealer for a return period, there shall be deducted from the tax payable for
the return period, a sum equal to,—

(a) the tax paid under sub-section (2) of section 6; and

(b) the tax paid under section 3 of the Tax on Entry of Goods into
Local Areas Act, 1994 (15 of 1994) on the import of any goods, other than those
included in the fourth schedule;

where such goods are sold or used in the manufacture of taxable
goods or used in the execution of works contract or for use as containers or as
packing materials for the packing of taxable goods in the State.”.

(7). for section 13, the following section shall be substituted,
namely :—

“13. Refund of input tax in the case of export or inter-State sale.—

(1) Every sale in the course of export shall be a zero rate sale.

(2) Where input tax has been paid in respect of the purchase of
any goods including capital goods, except those goods coming under the Fourth
Schedule, and such goods are either,—

(i) sold in the course of export; or

(ii) sold in the course of inter-State trade or commerce; or

(iii) sent to outside the State otherwise than by way of sale in
the course of inter-State trade; or

(iv) consumed in the manufacture of goods, other than those
falling under the First Schedule or Fourth Schedule and the goods so
manufactured are  sent outside the State either by way of sale in the course of
inter-State trade or commerce or otherwise; or



23

(v) used as Capital goods; the input tax paid on such goods
shall be refunded to the person making such sales in the course of export or in
the course of inter-State trade or commerce or sending such goods to outside
the State, as the case may be, in such manner and subject to such conditions as
may be prescribed :

Provided that the dealer claiming such refund shall not claim input tax
credit on such purchases for any return period :

Provided further that where the goods are sent to outside the State
otherwise than by way of sale in the course of inter-State trade or export or
where the sale in the course of inter-State trade is exempted from tax, the refund
under this section shall be limited to the amount of input tax paid in excess of
the rate specified under sub-section (1) of section 8 of the Central Sales Tax
Act, 1956 (Central Act 74 of 1956) on the purchase turnover of such goods
resold or used in the manufacture, as the case may be :

Provided also that in the case of capital goods, the refund of input tax will
be allowed in such instalments as may be prescribed.

(3) Nothing contained in sub-section (2) shall be construed as
preventing the assessing authority from adjusting any amount due as refund
under sub-section (1) towards any tax or other amount due from the dealer,
under this Act or under the provisions of the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963
(15 of 1963) or the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956 (Central Act 74 of 1956)  or The
Kerala Tax on Entry of Goods into Local Areas Act, 1994 (15 of 1994).

(4) The provisions of this section shall apply to goods purchased
by a dealer during a period of one year immediately preceding the date of
commencement of the Act and held by such dealers as opening stock on such
date.

Explanation : For the purpose of this section,—

(a) a ‘sale in the course of export’ means a sale falling under sub-
section (1) or sub-section (3) of section 5 of the Central Sales Tax Act, 1956
(Central Act 74 of 1956).

(b) “input tax” includes tax paid under sub-section (2) of section 6,
input tax covered by the Explanation to sub-section (13) of section 11 and the
tax paid under the Tax on Entry of Goods into Local Areas Act, 1994 (15 of
1994) on any taxable goods.”.



24

(8) for Section 14 the following  section shall be substituted,
namely :—

“14. Reimbursement of tax.—Where tax has been collected by any dealer
in the State on any sale effected under this Act to any official or personnel
of,—

(a) any foreign diplomatic mission or consulate in India ; or

(b) the United Nations or any other similar international body,
entitled to privileges under any convention to which India is a party or under
any law for the time being in force ; or

(c) any consular or diplomatic agent of any mission, the United
Nations or other body, the tax so collected shall  be reimbursed to such person,
mission, United Nations or  other body in such manner as may be prescribed.”;

(9) in section 16,—

(a)  in sub-section (1), for the Table and the provisos there under, the
following Table and provisos shall be substituted, namely :—

“TABLE

(a) Where the total turnover is less
than three lakh rupees

(b) Where the total turnover is three
lakh rupees and above but is less
than ten lakh rupees

(c) Where the total turnover is ten lakh
rupees and above but is less than
fifty lakh rupees

(d) Where the total turnover is fifty
lakh rupees and above

Five hundred rupees

Seven hundred and
fifty rupees

One thousand rupees
plus Twenty-five rupees
for each lakh or part
thereof above ten lakh

Two thousand rupees
plus fifty rupees for
each lakh or part
thereof above fifty lakh,
so however that  the
total registration fee
shall not exceed twenty
thousand rupees.



25

Provided that a dealer getting registered under clause (ii) of sub-section (2)
of section 15 shall not be required to pay the registration fee specified in this
sub-section; but only the fee for renewal of registration specified under
sub-section (7) :

Provided further that where the dealer is an authorized retail or wholesale
distributor of rationed articles under the Kerala Rationing Order, 1966, his total
turnover for the purpose of this sub-section shall not include the turnover in
respect of such goods :

Provided also that in the case of a casual trader, the minimum registration
fee to be paid shall be one thousand five hundred rupees and the registration
shall be valid for a period of three months from the date of issue of the
certificate.”;

(b) in sub-section (4), for the words “one hundred rupees”, the
words “one hundred and fifty rupees” shall be substituted ;

(c) in sub-section (7), for the words, figure and brackets “fee
specified in sub-section (1) and shall continue to be valid on such renewal” the
following words, figures and brackets shall be substituted, namely:—

  “ fee specified below :

(a) dealer who is not an importer Five hundred rupees
(b) others One thousand five hundred

rupees.”;

(d) after sub-section (12), the following sub-sections shall be
inserted,  namely :—

“(13) (i) Any dealer conducting exhibitions, exchange melas or any
prize schemes for sales promotion, shall obtain a written permission from the
assessing authority, with whom he is registered as a dealer on payment of a fee
of five hundred rupees.  The assessing authority may issue such permission in
such form and subject to such conditions as may be prescribed.  The dealer to
whom  the permission is issued shall exhibit the same at a conspicuous place
where the exhibition or exchange mela or prize scheme is conducted.

(ii) The owner of the premises (not being the regular business
place of the dealer) where the exhibition, exchange mela or any prize schemes for
sales promotion are conducted shall obtain a copy of the permission issued by



26

the assessing authority under clause (i) and intimate the assessing authority
concerned the particulars regarding the period during which the mela is
conducted, the dealer conducting the mela and the conditions subject to which
the premises are leased out for the conduct of such exhibition, exchange mela
or prize schemes and any other relevant  information.  Where the owner of the
premises fails to do so, he shall be jointly and severally liable for any tax that
may become due on the sales of goods made in such exhibition, exchange mela
or any prize schemes.”

(14) Every registered dealer shall be issued an electronic identity card
on payment of five hundred rupees and subject to such conditions as may be
prescribed. Add on cards may be issued to a dealer on payment of two hundred
and fifty rupees per card. The maximum number of add-on cards that may be
issued to a dealer shall not exceed three.

(15) Where a certificate of registration or an electronic identity card
issued under this section is lost, a duplicate certificate may be issued on
payment of One hundred rupees in the case of registration certificate and two
hundred and fifty rupees in the case of electronic identity card, subject to such
conditions as may be prescribed.”;

(10) in section 17; after proviso to sub-section (2) the following proviso
shall be inserted, namely :—

“ Provided further that no security or additional security shall be
demanded under this sub-section from a dealer falling under clause (ii) of
sub-section (2) of section 15”.

(11) in section 19,—

(a) in sub-section (4) for the words “one hundred rupees”, the
words “one hundred and fifty rupees” shall be substituted ;

(b) in sub-section (6), for the words, “one hundred rupees”, the
words, “one hundred and fifty rupees” shall be substituted.

(12) for sections 20, 21 and 22 the following sections shall be
substituted, namely :—

“20. Filing of returns.—(1) Every registered dealer and every dealer
liable to be registered under this Act shall submit to the assessing authority
such return or returns before  such dates and in such manner and accompanied
by such documents as may be prescribed.



27

 (2) In case of a dealer having more than one place of business, the
aggregate turnover of all such places of business shall, subject to the provisions
of sub-section (3), be taken as the turnover of the business for the purposes of
this Act.

 (3) The Commissioner may, on application by the dealer, treat each of
such places of business as a separate unit for the purposes of levy, assessment
and collection of tax, and thereupon all the provisions of this Act regarding
registration, filing of returns, assessment and collection of tax shall apply, as if
each of such places of business were a separate unit.

(4) Where any order is passed by the Commissioner under sub-
section (3), the turnover of each of such places of business shall be liable to
tax irrespective of such turnover being below the minimum turnover
mentioned in section 6 provided that the total turnover in respect of all such
places of business together shall not be less than the minimum turnover
mentioned in section 6.

 21. Self assessment.—Where the return submitted under sub-section (1) of
section 20 is in the prescribed manner and accompanied by the prescribed
documents, the assessment relating to the return period shall, subject to the
provisions of sections 22, 24 and section 25, be deemed to have been completed
on the receipt of such return.

22. Assessment in case of non-filing of return and filing of defective
return.—(1) Where  the return submitted under sub-section (1) of section 20 is
not in the prescribed manner or not accompanied by the prescribed documents
or with incorrect particulars, the assessing authority shall, after recording its
reasons, reject the return with due notice to the dealer.

(2) A dealer whose return is rejected under sub-section (1) may, file a
fresh return curing the defects in such manner and within such time as may be
prescribed  and accompanied by such documents as provided under sub-section
(1) of section 20 together with proof of payment of interest on the tax payable
at the rates provided under section 31 for the period from the due date of filing
of return till the date of filing of such fresh return.  On the receipt of such
return by the assessing authority, the assessment for the return period shall,
subject to the provisions of section 24 and section 25, be deemed to have been
completed.



28

(3) If any dealer fails to submit any return as provided under
sub-section (1) of section 20 or files incorrect return and fails to file a fresh
return as provided under sub-section (2), the assessing authority shall estimate
the turnover of the return period and complete the assessment to the best of its
judgment.

(4) No assessment under sub-section (3) of this section shall be
completed without affording the dealer an opportunity of  being heard.

(5) On receipt of the notice under sub-section (4), if the dealer files a
return for the return period as provided under sub-section (1) of section 20 and
accompanied by proof of payment of tax payable and interest on this amount
from the due date for filing of return till the date of filing of return at the rates
specified in section 31 and double the amount of interest so due as penalty the
assessing authority shall drop the proposal for assessment  under sub-section
(3)  and the assessment for the return period shall be deemed to have been
completed on receipt of such return.

(6) Any assessment, levy and collection of tax under this Act shall be
in such manner as may be prescribed.

(7) Notwithstanding anything contained in any other provision of this
Act, no appeal shall lie against the assessment completed under sub-section (3)
of this section unless the dealer has paid the entire tax assessed.”;

(13) in section 23,—

(i) in sub-section (1), the following sentence shall be inserted at
the end, namely :—

            “The officer so designated and the audit officers shall follow  the
procedure as may be notified by Government.”;

(ii) in sub-section (6), for the words, “all the return periods upto
the previous audit visit shall be liable to be disallowed and the assessments of
the return periods liable to be completed to the best of judgment”, the following
shall be substituted, namely :—

     “ the four return periods immediately preceding the date of such audit visit
shall be liable to be disallowed and the assessments of such return periods
liable to be completed to the best of judgment as provided under section 24.” ;

(iii) in sub-section (6) for the  figures “11, 21 and 22” the figures
“11, 20, 21 and 22” shall be substituted. ;



29

(14) in section 30,—

(a) in sub-section (1), the words “and pay it over to Government in
such manner as may be prescribed” shall be added at the end.

(b) for sub-section (4) the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely :—

“(4) No registered  dealer whose turnover is below the limit specified
under sub-section (1) of section 6 shall collect any sum purporting to be by way
of tax.”;

(15) in section 31, for sub-section (5) the following sub-section  shall
be substituted,  namely :—

“(5) If the tax or any other amount assessed or due under this Act is
not paid by any dealer or any other person within the time prescribed therefore
in this Act or in any rule made thereunder and in other cases within the time
specified therefore in the notice of demand, the dealer or the other person, shall
pay simple interest at the rate of twelve per cent per annum on the tax or other
amount defaulted.”;

(16) for sectio n 32, the following section shall be substituted,
namely: —

“32. Deferment of tax payable by Industrial Units.—(1) Subject to such
conditions and restrictions, the Government may, by notification, order to defer
the payment of the whole or any part of the tax payable by any industrial unit
in respect of which exemption in respect of tax payable under the Kerala General
Sales Tax Act, 1963 (15 of 1963) or the Kerala Surcharge on Taxes Act, 1957 (11
of 1957) had been granted or is due to be granted under any notification issued
under Section 10 of the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 (15 of 1963), under
the Industrial Policy of the State, and that the tax or taxes so deferred shall be
repaid, after the expiry of the period for which such exemption had been granted,
in equal instalments over a period of five years in  such manner as may be
specified.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act but subject to such
conditions as the Government may, by general or special order specify, where in
respect of an industrial unit deferment is granted under sub-section (1) and
where liability equal to the amount of any such tax deferred has been created as
a loan by Government, such tax deferred shall not attract interest under sub-
section (5) of Section 31 during the period for which deferment is granted.”;



30

(17) in section 48 for sub-section (4) the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely :—

“(4) where any person consigns any goods or transports any goods
liable to tax under this Act from another State into the State without any records
as provided for under section 46 or where the particulars furnished in the
documents accompanying the goods are false or the consignor or purchaser
stated therein is found to be bogus or non-existent or is not traceable or where
the transporter fails to prove the bona fides of the transport, it shall be
presumed that such goods have been sold in the State by the consignor or the
owner of the goods or the transports or the owner or persons in charge of the
vehicle or the person in charge of the goods or all of them jointly and they shall
be jointly and severally liable to pay tax on such sales which shall be assessed
and recovered in the manner provided for in sub-section (3).”;

(18) in Section 49,—

(a) in the second proviso to sub-section (3) for the word “penalty”
the words  “redemption fee” shall be substituted ;

(b) for sub-sections (4) and (5), the following sub-sections shall be
substituted, namely :—

“(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing provisions,
if the owner or person in charge of the notified goods or the owner or person
in charge of  the vehicle fails to prove the genuineness of the transport of the
notified goods or to remit the redemption fee  as specified in second proviso to
sub-section (3), within thirty days from the seizure and detention of goods and
the authorized officer has reason to believe that the owner or the person in
charge of the vehicle or the driver has transported the notified goods to evade
payment of tax with the knowledge or connivance of the owner of the goods,
the officer may confiscate the vehicle or vessel along with the goods :

Provided that the authorized officer shall serve notice to the owner of the
vehicle or the person in charge of the vehicle or the owner of the notified
goods, if ascertainable, intimating the  reason for the confiscation of the vehicle
or vessel affording him and an opportunity of being heard.   The officer shall
also afford an opportunity to any of such persons  to pay a penalty equal to
thrice the amount of tax attempted to be evaded in lieu of confiscation of the
notified  goods  and an amount equal to thrice the amount of such tax or
rupees one lakh whichever is higher in lieu of confiscation of the  vehicle or
vessel.



31

(5) No order confiscating any vehicle or vessel shall be made under
sub-section (4), if the owner or the person in charge of the vehicle or vessel
proves to the satisfaction of the authorized officer that it was used for carrying
the notified goods without the knowledge or connivance of the owner himself,
his agent, if any, or the person in charge of such vehicle or vessel and that each
of them has taken all reasonable and necessary precautions against such use.”;

(18A) After Section 49 the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“49A. Police Assistance for inspection, search and seizure.—An officer
authorised under the provisions of this Act to conduct inspection, search or
seizure of any vehicle or vessel, goods, business place, residential
accommodation or any other place, if feels necessary to have police assistance
for the effective conduct of such inspection, search or seizure may seek police
assistance from the officer in charge of the police station or from his superior
officer having jurisdiction over the area where inspection, search or seizure is to
be conducted or is being conducted and thereupon such police officer shall
render such assistance to the officer as may be required for the conduct of such
inspection, search or seizure.”

(19) in Section 67,—

(a)  in sub-section (1), for the words “twenty-five thousand rupees”,
the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted ;

(b)   in sub-section (2), for the words “at thrice the balance amount
of tax” and “thrice the complete amount so assessed”, the words “at twice the
balance amount of tax”, and  “twice the complete amount so assessed” shall
respectively be substituted ;

(20) in section 69, in sub-section (1), for the words “ten thousand
rupees”, the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substituted ;

(21) in section  70, for the words “fifty thousand rupees”, the words
“twenty-five thousand rupees” shall be substituted ;

(22) for section 71, the following section shall be substituted,
namely :—

 “71. Punishment for submitting untrue return etc .—(1) Any person
who,—

(a) knowingly submits an untrue return or fails to submit return as
required by the provisions of this Act or the rules made thereunder; or



32

(b) fails to keep true and complete accounts; or

(c) dishonestly objects to or fails to comply with the terms of a
notice  issued to him under sub-section (1) of section 35; or

(d) being a person obliged to register himself as a dealer under this
Act does not get himself registered; or

(e) fails to  stop any vehicle or vessel when required to do so by
an officer empowered in this behalf; or

(f) wilfully acts in contravention of any of the provisions of this Act
or the rules made thereunder, for the contravention of which no express
provision  for punishment is made by this Act, shall, on conviction by a
Magistrate, be liable to fine which may extend to twenty-five thousand rupees.

(2) Any person who,—

(a) makes any bogus claim of input tax credit or refund, or

(b) continues the business during the period of suspension of
registration, or

(c) prevents or obstructs survey, inspection, entry, search, checking
of tax invoice or seizure by an officer empowered under this Act, or

(d) prevents or obstructs inspection of any vehicle or vessel or
goods transported otherwise or seizure of goods by an officer in charge of a
check post or barrier or by any officer empowered under this Act, or

(e) fraudulently evades the payment of tax, fee or other amount due
from him under this Act, or

(f) carries on business as a dealer without  furnishing the security
demanded under sub-section (1) of section 17, shall, on conviction by a
Magistrate, be punished with simple imprisonment for a period which may extend
to six months or to fine not less than the tax or other amounts due but not
exceeding fifty thousand rupees or to both.”;

(23) in section 73 for the words “which shall not be less than three
months but which may extend to six months and shall also be liable to fine not
exceeding fifty thousand rupees”, the words “which may extend to six months or
with fine not exceeding fifty thousand rupees or with both” shall be
substituted ;



33

(24) after section 79, the following section shall be inserted, namely:—

“79A. Bar against attachment in certain cases .—Notwithstanding
anything contained in any other law in force or in any judgment, decree or order
of any court, no court or any other authority shall pass any order attaching
any amount  from any person,  out of the tax collected by such person under
the Act and kept  with him before it became due to Government.”;

(25) in section 85, in sub-section (2) after clause (x) the following
clause shall be inserted, namely :—

  “(xi) to an officer of Government of India or the Government of any
State or Union Territory of India, where such disclosure is on the basis of the
decision of the Empowered Committee.”;

(25A) in sub-section (1) of section 93 the words “except where such
enhancement is to implement a decision of the Empowered Committee” shall be
inserted at the end ;

(26) for section 98, the following section shall be substituted,
namely :—

   “98. Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 (15 of 1963) to have limited
application .— (1) From the date of commencement of this Act, the Kerala
General Sales Tax Act, 1963 (15 of 1963) shall apply only in respect of goods
included in the Fourth Schedule to this Act.

(2) Goods taxable under the said Act at the point of last purchase in
the State, which are held as closing stock on the date preceding the date of
coming into force of this Act, shall be deemed to have acquired the quality of
last purchase under the provisions of the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 on
such date and tax shall be levied accordingly.

(3) Notwithstanding anything in sub-section (1), Government may
permit the use of the registration certificates issued under the provisions of the
said Act and also of such forms prescribed by  the rules made thereunder by
any dealer to whom the provisions of this Act applies,  till the thirtieth day of
June, 2005.

 (4) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (i), in respect
of the goods coming under the purview of the Kerala Value Added Tax Act, 2003
(30 of 2004), nothing shall affect the right to initiate and complete any
proceedings pending at the commencement of the Kerala Value Added Tax Act,
2003 regarding the assessment, levy, collection and recovery of tax, penalty or
other amount chargeable under the Kerala General Sales Tax Act, 1963 including



34

1 Agricultural implements manually operated or animal driven

(1) Spades and shovels 8201.10.00

(2) Forks 8201.20.00

(3) Mattocks, picks, hoes and rakes 8201.30.00

(4) Axes, bill hooks and similar hewing tools 8201.40.00

(5) Secateurs and similar one-handed pruners  and  shears
(including poultry shears) 8201.50.00

(6) Hedge shears,  two-handed pruning  shears and similar
 two-handed shears 8201.60.00

(7) Other hand tools of a kind used in agriculture, horticul-
ture or forestry 8201.90.00

2 Aids & implements used by handicapped persons

(1) Orthopaedic or fracture appliances 9021.10.00

(2) Artificial joints 9021.31.00

(3) Frequency  modulated  hearing aid  system  used  for
hearing by handicapped persons in group situation 9021.40.10

“ FIRST SCHEDULE

Goods exempted from tax under sub-section (4) of Section 6

Sl. No. Description of Goods HSN Code

(1) (2) (3)

that of escaped turnover, or affect the liability of any person to pay any sum
due from him or existing right of refund under the said Act, or the right to
initiate or continue any application, appeal, revision including suo moto revision
or other proceedings made or preferred to any officer or authority under the
said Act.”.

(27) for the Schedules the following Schedules shall be substituted,
namely :—



35

(4) Carriages for disabled persons, whether or not motorised
or otherwise mechanically propelled

(a) Wheel chairs for invalids (including motorised) 8713.10.10
(b) Other Wheel chairs for invalids 8713.90.10

(5) Braille typewriters

(a) Braille typewriters (electric) 8469.20.10
(b) Braille typewriters (non-electric) 8469.30.10

3 Aquatic feed, poultry feed and its supplements & cattle feed, including
grass, hay, etc. but excluding those specifically mentioned in Schedule II

(1) Bran, sharps and other residues, whether or not in the
form of  pellets,  derived  from the sifting,  milling  or
other working of cereals or of leguminous plants

          (a) Maize bran 2302.10.10
          (b) Deoiled rice bran 2302.20.10
          (c) Rice bran raw 2302.20.20
          (d) Bran of wheat 2302.30
          (e) Of  other cereals 2302.40.00
          (f) of leguminous plants 2302.50.00

(2) Vegetable  materials  and  vegetable  waste,  vegetable
residues and by-products, whether or not in the form of
pellets of a kind used in  animal feeding, not elsewhere
specified or included 2308.00.00

(3) Preparations of kind used in animal feeding
         (a) Dog or cat food 2309.10.10
         (b) Compounded animal feed 2309.90.10
         (c) Concentrates for compound animal feed 2309.90.20
         (d) Prawn, shrimp and poultry feed 2309.90.31
         (e) Fish meal in powdered form 2309.90.32
         (f) Other feeds for fish 2309.90.39
         (g) Others 2309.90.90

(4) Hay and fodder 1214.90.00

4 Betal leaves 1404.90.40

(1) (2) (3)



(1) (2) (3)

36

5 Books and periodicals & journals

(1) Books

(a) Printed books meant for reading 4901.10.10

(b) Dictionaries and encyclopaedias and serial
instalments thereof 4901.91.00

(c) Journals and periodicals 4902.10.20

(2) Children’s picture, drawing or colouring  books

(a) Picture books 4903.00.10
(b) Drawing or colouring books 4903.00.20

6 Candle 3406.00.10

7 Cart driven by animals 8716.80.20

8 Charcoal

(1) Wood charcoal (including shell or nut charcoal),
whether or not agglomerated

(a) Of coconut shell 4402.00.10

(b) Other 4402.00.90

9 Coarse grains other than paddy, rice and wheat

(1) Rye 1002.00.90

(2) Barley 1003.00.90

(3) Oats 1004.90

(4) Maize (Corn) 1005.90.00

(5) Grain sorghum 1007.00.90

(6) Buckwheat 1008.00.90

(7) Jawar 1008.20.19

(8) Bajra 1008.20.29

(9) Ragi 1008.20.39

(10) Canary seed 1008.30.90

(11) Other cereals 1008.90.90



(1) (2) (3)

37

10 Condoms and contraceptives

(1) Contraceptive pills
(2) Rubber contraceptives, male (condoms) 4014.10.10
(3) Rubber contraceptives, female (diaphragms), such as

cervical caps 4014.10.20

11 Cotton & silk yarn in hank

(1) Cotton

(a) Cotton yarn (other than sewing thread), containing
85% or more by weight of cotton, not put up for
retail sale 5205

(b) Cotton yarn (other than sewing thread),
containing less than 85% by weight of cotton,
not put up for retail sale 5206

(c) Cotton yarn (other than sewing thread) put up
for retail sale 5207

(2) Silk

(a) Silk yarn ( other than yarn spun from silk waste)
not put up for retail sale 5004

(b) Yarn spun from silk waste, not put up for retail sale 5005

(c) Silk yarn and yarn spun from silk waste, put up
 for retail sale, silk worm gut 5006

12 Charkha, Amber Charkha, Handlooms, Handloom fabrics
and Gandhi Topi

13 Curd, Lussi, butter milk & separated milk

(1) Curd and fresh ( unripened or uncured)  cheese,
including whey cheese 0406.10.00

(2) Yogurt 0403.10.00
(3) Butter milk 0403.90.10
(4) Others 0403.90.90

14 Electrical energy 2716.00.00

15 Earthen pot 6914.90.00



(1) (2) (3)

38

16 Fresh milk and pasteurised milk

(1) Milk and cream, not concentrated nor containing
added sugar or other sweetening matter 0401

(2) Milk and cream, concentrated not containing added
sugar or other sweetening matter 0402.91.90

(3) Other whole milk 0402.99.10

17 Fresh plants, saplings and fresh flowers

(1) Bulbs, tubers, tuberous roots, corms, crowns and
rhizomes, dormant, in growth or in flower; chicory
plants and roots other than roots of heading No.1212

(a) Bulbs, tubers, tuberous roots, corms, crowns and
rhizomes, dormant 0601.10.00

(b) Bulbs, horticultural 0601.20.10
(c) Chicory

(i) Chicory plants 0601.20.21

(ii) Chicory roots 0601.20.22

(iii) Other 0601.20.90

(2) Other live plants (including their roots), cuttings and
slips; mushroom spawn

(a) Unrooted cuttings and slips 0602.10.00
(b) Edible fruit or nut trees, grafted or not 0602.20.10
(c) Cactus 0602.20.20
(d) Rhododerndrons and azaleas, grafted or not 0602.30.00
(e) Roses, grafted or not 0602.40.00
(f) Mushroom spawn 0602.90.10
(g) Flowering plants (excluding roses and rhododerndrons) 0602.90.20
(h) Tissue culture plant 0602.90.30
(i) Other 0602.90.90

(3) Fresh flowers  and flower buds of a kind suitable for
bouquets or for ornamental purposes, fresh 0603.10.00

18 Fishnet & Fishnet fabrics

(1) Made up fishing nets of nylon 5608.11.10



(1) (2) (3)

39

19 Fresh vegetables & fruits

(1) Potatoes, fresh or chilled 0701.90.00
(2) Tomatoes, fresh or chilled 0702.00.00
(3) Onions, shallots, leeks and other alliaceous

vegetables, fresh or chilled

(a) Onions 0703.10.10
(b) Shallots 0703.10.20
(c) Leeks and other alliaceous vegetables 0703.90.00

(4) Cabbages, cauliflowers,  kohlrabi,  kale  and  similar
edible brassicas, fresh or chilled

(a) Cauliflowers and headed broccoli 0704.10.00
(b) Brussels sprouts 0704.20.00
(c) Others 0704.90.00

(5) Lettuce (lactuca sativa) and chicory, fresh or chilled

(a) Cabbage lettuce (head lettuce) 0705.11.00
(b) Other lettuce 0705.19.00
(c) Witloof chicory 0705.21.00
(d) Other chicory 0705.29.00

(6) Carrots,  turnips,  salad  beetroot,  salsify,  celeriac,
radishes and similar edible roots, fresh or chilled

(a) Carrots and turnips 0706.10.00
(b) Horse radish 0706.90.10
(c) Other radish 0706.90.20
(d) Salad beetroot 0706.90.30
(e) Other 0706.90.90

(7) Cucumbers or gherkins, fresh or chilled 0707.00.00

(8) Leguminous vegetables, shelled  or unshelled,  fresh
or chilled
(a) Peas 0708.10.00
(b) Beans 0708.20.00
(c) Others leguminous vegetables 0708.90.00

(9) Manioc (cassava), fresh or chilled 0714.10.00

(10) Sweet potatoes, fresh or chilled 0714.20.00



(1) (2) (3)

40

(11) Other vegetables, fresh or chilled

(a) Globe artichokes 0709.10.00
(b) Asparagus 0709.20.00
(c) Aubergines (egg-plants) 0709.30.00
(d) Celery other than celeraic 0709.40.00
(e) Mushrooms of the genus Agaricus 0709.51.00
(f) Other mushrooms 0709.59.00
(g) Truffles 0709.52.00
(h) Green chilly 0709.60.10
(i) Other capsicum 0709.60.90
(j) Spinach and Orache spinach 0709.70.00
(k) Olives 0709.90.10
(l) Curry banana 0709.90.20
(m) Pumpkins 0709.90.30

(12) Bananas, including plaintains 0803.00.00
(13) Figs 0804.20.10
(14) Pineapples 0804.30.00
(15) Avocados 0804.40.00
(16) Gauvas 0804.50.10
(17) Mangoes 0804.50.20
(18) Oranges 0805.10.00
(19) Mandarins  (including  tangerines  and  satsumas)

Clementines,wilkings and similar citrus hybrids 0805.20.00
(20) Grape fruit 0805.40.00
(21) Lemon and limes 0805.50.00
(22) Grapes 0806.10.00
(23) Watermelons 0807.11.00
(24) Other melons 0807.19.00
(25) Papaws (papayas) 0807.20.00
(26) Apples 0808.10.00
(27) Pears and quinces 0808.20.00
(28) Apricots 0809.10.00
(29) Cherries 0809.20.00
(30) Peaches including nectarines 0809.30.00
(31) Plums and sloes 0809.40.00
(32) Strawberries 0810.10.00
(33) Raspberries, blackberries, mulberries and loganberries 0810.20.00



(1) (2) (3)

41

(34) Black, white or red currants and gooseberries 0810.30.00
(35) Cranberries, bilberries and other fruits of the genus

vaccinium 0810.40.00
(36) Kiwifruit 0810.50.00
(37) Durians 0810.60.00
(38) Pomegranates 0810.90.10
(39) Sapota (chico) 0810.90.30
(40) Custard apple (ata) 0810.90.40
(41) Bore 0810.90.50
(42) Lichi 0810.90.60

20 Garlic and green ginger

(1) Garlic

(a) fresh 0703.20.00
(b) dried 0712.90.40

(2) Ginger, fresh 0910.10.10

21 Glass Bangles 7018.10.10

22 Green and soaked coconut husk, coconut fibre, coir and coir products
     other than rubberised

(1) Green coconut husk
(2) Soaked coconut husk
(3) Raw,  coir bristle fibre 5305.11.10
(4) Raw, mattress fibre 5305.11.20
(5) Coir yarn
(6) Coir products other than rubberised coir products

23 Handmade safety matches

24 Human Blood and blood plasma

(1) Human blood 3002.90.10
(2) Blood plasma 3002 .10

25 Indigeneous handmade musical instruments

(1) Harmoniums 9203.00.10
(2) Flutes 9205.90.10
(3) Drums 9206.00.00



(1) (2) (3)

42

26 Kumkum, Bindi, Alta and Sindur 3304.99.40

27 Life Saving medicine

(1) Vaccines of human medicine

(i) Single Vaccine

(a) For Cholera and typhoid 3002.20.11

(b) For hepatitis 3002.20.12
(c) for tetanus 3002.20.13

(d) for polio 3002.20.14

(e) for tuberculosis 3002.20.15

(f) for rabies 3002.20.16

(g) for japanese Enceephalitis 3002.20.17
(h) for whooping cough (pertusis) 3002.20.18

(i) Others 3002.20.19

(ii) Mixed Vaccines

(a) for diphtheria, pertutis and tetanus (DPT) 3002.20.21

(b) for diphtheria and tetanus 3002.20.22
(c) for measels, mumps and rubella (MMR) 3002.20.23

(d) for typhoid-para typhoid (TAB) ortyphoid

para typhoid cholera (TABC) 3002.20.24

(e) Others 3002.20.29

(2) Vaccines for veterinary medicine 3002.30.00
(3) Animal   blood prepared  for  therapeutic,

prophylactic or diagonostic uses 3002.90.20

(4) Cultures of micro organisms (excluding yeast) 3002.90.30

(5) Toxins 3002.90.40

(6) Anti sera

(a) for diphtheria 3002.10.11
(b) for tetanus 3002.10.12

(c) for rabies 3002.10.13

(d) for snake venom 3002.10.14

(e) Others 3002.10.15



(1) (2) (3)

43

(7) Hemoglobin bloodglobulins and serum globulins 3002.10.20

(8) Insulin Injuction 3002.31.10
(9) Cyclosporine

28 Meat, fish, prawn and other aquatic products when not cured or
frozen, eggs and livestock other than poultry and animal hair

(1) Meat of bovine animals, fresh and chilled
(a) Carcasses and half-carcasses 0201.10.00
(b) Other cuts with bone in 0201.20.00
(c) Boneless 0202.30.00

(2) Meat of swine, fresh or chilled

(a) Carcasses and half-carcasses 0203.11.00
(b) Hams, shoulders and cuts thereof with bone in 0203.12.00
(c) Other 0203.19.00

(3) Meat of sheep or goats, fresh or chilled

(a) Carcasses and half-carcasses of lamb, fresh or chilled 0204.10.00
(b) Other meat of sheep, fresh or chilled

(i) Carcasses or half-carcasses 0204.21.00
(ii) Other cuts with bone in 0204.22.00
(iii) Boneless 0204.23.00

(4) Meat of horses, asses, mules or hinnies, fresh or chilled 0205.00.00
(5) Edible offal of

(a) Bovine animals, fresh or chilled 0206.10.00
(b) Swine, fresh or chilled 0206.30.00
(c) Sheep or goats, fresh or chilled 0206.80.10
(d) Others 0206.80.90

(6) Other meat and edible meat offal, fresh or chilled
(a) of rabbits or hares 0208.10.00
(b) frog’s legs 0208.20.00
(c) primates 0208.30.00
(d) whales, dolphins and porpoises; of manatees

and dugongs 0208.40.00
(e) reptiles (including snakes and turtles) 0208.50.00
(f) Other

(i) of wild animals 0208.90.10
(ii) other 0208.90.90



(1) (2) (3)

44

(7) Live fish

(a) Ornamental fish 0301.10.00
(b) Trout 0301.91.00
(c) Eels 0301.92.00
(d) Carp 0301.93.00
(e) Other 0301.99.00

(8) Fish, fresh or chilled, excluding fish fillets and other fish
meat of heading 0304 0302

(9) Fish fillets and other fish meat (whether or not minced),
fresh or chilled 0304.10.00

(10) Crustaceans, whether in shell or not, live, fresh or chilled
(a) Rock lobster and other sea craw fish 0306.21.00
(b) Lobsters 0306.22.00
(c) Shrimps and prawns 0306.23.90
(d) Crabs 0306.24.00

(11) Molluscus whether, in shell or not, live, fresh or chilled

(a) Oysters 0307.10.00
(b) Scallops, including queen scallops 0307.21.00
(c) Mussels 0307.31.00
(d) Clams, clam meat 0307.39.10
(e) Cuttle fish 0307.41.10
(f) Squid 0307.41.20
(g) Octopus 0307.51.00
(h) Snails other sea snails 0307.60.00
(i) Others 0307.91.00

(12) Eggs

(a) of the species gallus domesticus and ducks for
hatching 0407.00.10

(b) Eggs of the species gallus and ducks other than for
hatching 0407.00.20

(c) other 0407.00.90



(1) (2) (3)

45

(13) Live stock

(a) Horses, asses, mules and hinnies 0101
(b) Bovine animals 0102
(c) Swine 0103
(d) Sheep and goats 0104
(e) Other (excluding poultry) 0106

(14) Animal Hair

(a) Pigs’, hogs’ or boars’  bristles and hair; badger hair and
other brush making hair, wast of such bristles or hair 0502

(b) Horse hair and horse hair waste whether or not put up
as a layer with or without supporting material 0503.00.00

(c) Fine or coarse animal hair, not carded or combed 5102

29 National Flag 6307.90.90

30 Non-judicial stamp paper sold by Govt. Treasuries, postal items like
envelope, postcard etc. sold by Govt., rupee note and cheques

(1) Unused postage, revenue or similar stamps of current or new
issue in the country in which they have, or will have a
recognised face value 4907.00.10

(2) Bank notes 4907.00.20
(3) Other 4907.00.90

31 Organic manure

(1) Animal or vegetable fertiliser
(a) Guano 3101.00.10

(aa) Wood ash, green manure, Compost, neem cake
and crushed neems fruit 3101.00.10

(ab) Others 3101.00.10
(b) Animal dung 3101.00.91
(c) Animal excreta 3101.00.92
(d) Fishmanure, Poultrymanure 3101.00.99
(e) Others 3101.00.99

32 Prasadam by religious institutions
33 Pulpaya, Thazhapaya 4601.20.20
34 Raw wool

(1) Greasy, including fleece-washed wool
(a) Shorn wool 5101.11.00
(b) Other 5101.19.00



(1) (2) (3)

46

(2) Degreased, not carbonised
(a) Shorn wool 5101.21.00
(b) Other 5101.29.00

(3) Carbonised 5101.30.00

35 Semen including frozen semen

(1) Bovine semen 0511.10.00
(2) Frozen semen, other than bovine 0511.99.91

36 Slate and slate pencils

(1) Slates and boards, with writing or drawing surfaces 9610.00.00
(2) Slate pencils 9609.90.10

37 Silk worm laying, cocoon & raw silk

(1) Silk worm cocoons suitable for reeling 5001.00.00
(2) Raw Silk (not thrown)

(a) Mulberry raw silk 5002.00.10
(b) Mulberry dupion silk 5002.00.20
(c) Non-mulberry silk 5002.00.30

38 Smokeless Country oven

39 Sugar and Khandasari 1701.11

40 Tender green coconut 0801.19.90

41 Textiles fabric

(1) Silk fabrics 5007
(2) Wool

(a) Woven fabrics of carded wool or of carded fine
animal hair 5111

(b) Woven fabrics of comb ed wool or of combed fine
animal hair 5112

(c) Woven fabrics of coarse animal hair or of horse hair 5113

(3) Cotton

(a) Woven  fabrics  of  cotton containing  85%  or more
by weight of cotton weighing not more than 200gm/m2 5208

(b) Woven  fabrics  of  cotton containing  85% or  more
by weight of  cotton weighing  more  than  200gm/m2 5209



(1) (2) (3)

47

(c) Woven fabrics of  cotton containing less than  85%
by weight of cotton, mixed mainly or solely with man
made fibres, weighing not more than 200gm/m2 5210

(d) Woven fabrics of  cotton containing less than  85%
by weight of cotton, mixed mainly or solely with man
made fibres, weighing more than 200gm/m2 5211

(e) Other woven fabrics of cotton 5212

   (4) Man-made filaments

(a) Woven fabrics of synthetic filament yarn, including
woven fabrics obtained from materials of heading 5404 5407

(b) Woven fabrics of artificial  filament yarn, including
woven fabrics obtained from materials of heading 5405 5408

(5) Man-made Staple Fibres

(a) Woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibres, containing
85% or more by weight of synthetic staple fibres 5512

(b) Woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibres, containing
less than 85%  by weight of such fibres mixed mainly
or solely with cotton of a weight not exceeding 170 m2 5513

(c) Woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibres, containing
less than 85%  by weight of such fibres mixed mainly
or solely with cotton of a weight exceeding 170 m2 5514

(d) Other woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibres 5515

(e) Woven fabrics of artificial staple fibres 5516

(6) Special  Woven  fabrics; Tufted  textile  fabrics;  Lace,
Tapestries, Trimmings; Embroidery

(a) Woven pile fabrics and chennile fabrics other than
heading No. 5802 or 5806 5801

(b) Terry towelling and similar woven terry fabrics other
than narrow fabrics of heading number 5806; tufted
textile fabrics other than heading number 5703 5802



(1) (2) (3)

48

(c) Gauze other than narrow fabrics of heading 5806 5803

(d) Tullies  and  other  net fabrics not including woven,
knitted  or crochetted  fabrics; lace  in  the piece, in
strips  or  in motifs, other  than  fabrics of  heading
6002 to 6006 5804

(e) Hand woven tapestries of the type gobelins, flanders,
aubusson, beauvals and  the like and needle worked
tapestries  (for  example  petit  point,  cross  stitch),
whether or not made up 5805

(f) Narrow wovens fabrics other than goods heading 5807;
narrow fabrics consisting warp without weft assembled
by means of an adhesive (bolducs) 5806

(g) Labels, badges and similar articles of textile materials,
in the  piece, in strips  or cut to  shape  or size, not
embroidered 5807

(h) Braids  in  the  piece;  Ornamental trimmings  in the
piece,  without  embroidery,  other  than  knitted or
crocheted;  tassels,  pompons  and  similar  articles 5808

(i) Woven  fabrics  or metal thread  and woven fabrics
of metalised  yarn of heading 5605 of  a kind used
in apparel as furnishing fabrics of a similar purposes,
not elsewhere specified or included 5809

(j) Quilted textile product  in  the  piece, composed  of
one or more  layers  of  textile  materials  assembled
with padding  by stitching  or  otherwise, other than
embroidery of heading 5810 5811

(7) Knitted or chrocheted fabrics

(a) Pile  fabrics,  including ‘long pile’  fabrics and terry
fabrics, knitted or chrocheted 6001

(b) Knitted or chrocheted fabrics of a width not exceeding
30 cm, containing by weight 5% or more of elasto meric
yarn of rubber thread, other than those of heading 6001 6002



(1) (2) (3)

49

(c ) knitted of chrocheted fabrics of a width not exceeding
30 cm, other than those of heading 6001 or 6002 6003

(d ) knitted of chrocheted fabrics of a width  exceeding
30 cm, containing by weight 5% or more of elasto
meric yarn or  rubber thread, other than those of
heading 6001 6004

(e) Wrap knitt fabrics (including those made on gallon
knitting machines), other than those of headings
6001 to 6004 6005

(f) Other knitted or chrocheted fabrics 6006

42 Tobacco

(1) Unmanufactured tobacco; tobacco refuse 2401

(2) Smoking tobacco, whether or not containing tobacco
substitutes in any proportion 2403.10

(3) “Homogenised” or “reconstituted” tobacco 2403.91.00

(4) Other 2403.99.90

43 Toddy, Neera 2206.00.00

44 Unbranded bread

45 Unprocessed and unbranded salt

(1) Rock salt 2501.00.20
(2) Other 2501.00.90

46 Water other than aerated, mineral, distilled, medicinal,
ionic, battery, de-mineralised and water sold in sealed
container 2201.90

47 Printed forms of court and P.S.C applications.

48 Rice issued from Central/State Governments depots for
sale by authorised ration dealers



(1) (2) (3)

50

49 Products notified by the Khadi and Village industries Commission, at
the point of sale by the manufacturing unit whose annual turnover does not
exceed twenty five lakhs.

(1) Handmade matches, fireworks and agarbathies

(2) Handmade soaps

(3) Tanned of hids and skins and ancillary industries connected with
the same

(4) handmade leather goods

(5) handmade paper

(6) cane gur and khandasary

(7) manure and methane gas from cowdung and other waste products

(8) lame products

(9) shellac

(10) Manufacture of vegetable and fruit products

(11) bamboo and cane goods

(12) Products of blacksmithy other than furniture

(13) carpentary other than manufacture of furniture

(14) fibre products other than coir

(15) household utensils in aluminium

(16) mize and ragi products

(17) dipped rubber latex products such as rubber band, gloves and
baloon

(18) palm products

(19) pottery

(20) honey

(21) ghani oil

50. Products of Kdumbasree units whose annual turnover does not
exceed twenty five lakhs





54

12 Bicycles, tricycles, cycle rickshaws and parts

(1) Bicycles 8712.00.10
(2) Tricycles, cycle rickshaws 8712.00.90
(3) Parts 8714

13 Bone meal 0506.90

14 Branded bread

(1) Crisp bread 1905.10.00
(2) Ginger bread and the like 1905.20.00

15 Bulk drugs

(1) Keytones and Quinones  whether  or  not  with  other
oxygen function, and  their  halogenated,  sulfonated,
nitrated or nitrosated derivatives 2914

(2) Oxygen—function amino compounds 2922
(3) Organic derivatives of hydrazin or of hydroxylamine 2928
(4) Other organo-inorganic compounds 2931
(5) Heterocyclic compounds with oxygen  hetero-atom (s)

only 2932
(6) Heterocyclic compounds with nitrogen hetero-atom (s)

only 2933
(7) Nucleic acids and their salts whether or not chemically

defined other hetereo  cyclic compounds 2934
(8) Sulphonamides 2935

16 Castings

(1) Pig iron and spiegeleisen in pigs, blocks or other
primary forms 7201

(2) Tube or pipe fittings (e.g. couplings, elbows, sleeves, of
iron or steel) 7307

(3) Table, kitchen or other  household  articles  and  parts
thereof of iron or steel; iron or steel wool; pot scourers
and scouring or polishing pads, gloves and the like, of
iron or steel 7323

17 Centrifugal and monoblock and submersible pumps and parts

(1) Centrifugal and monoblock and submersible pumps 8413
(2) parts 8413.91

(1) (2) (3)



55

18 Clay including fireclay

(1) Kaolin and other kaolinic clays, whether or not calcined 2507

(2) (a) Other  clays  (not  including  expanded   clays  of
heading 6806), and alusite, kyanite and  sillimanite,
whether or not calcined; Mullite, Chamotte or dinas
earths 2508

(b) Fire clay 2508.3

19 Coal

(a) Anthracite 2701.11.00
(b) Bituminous coal 2701.12.00
(c) Coking coal 2701.19.10
(d) Steam coal 2701.19.20
(e) Anthracite agglomerated 2701.20.10

Other 2701.20.90
20 Coffee beans and seeds, cocoa pod, green tea leaf and chicory

(1) Coffee beans and coffee seeds 0901
(2) Cocoa pod, 1801
(3) Green tea leaf (not fermented) 0902.10
(4) Manufactured Tea 902.2
(5) Chicory

              (a) Witloof chicory 0705.21.00
              (b) Other chicory 0705.29.00

21 Chemical fertilizers, pesticides, weedicides, insecticides other
      than those specifically included in the first schedule.

(1) Animal  or vegetable fertilisers  whether or  not  mixed
together or chemically treated; Fertilisers produced  by
the mixing or chemical treatment o f animalo r vegetable
products 3101

(2) Mineral or chemical fertilisers, nitrogenous 3102
(3) Mineral or chemical fertilisers, phosphatic 3103
(4) Mineral or chemical fertilisers, potassic 3104
(5) Mineral or chemical  fertilisers containing two or  three

of  the fertilising  elements  nitrogen,  phosphorus and
potassium; Other fertilisers 3105

(6) pesticides 3808.90.10
(7) weedicides 3808.30.50
(8) insecticides 3808.10.00

(1) (2) (3)



56

22 Cotton and cotton waste

(1) Cotton 5201
(2) Cotton waste 5202

23 Crucibles 6903.20.10

24 Dates 0804.10.10

25 Drugs  and  medicines  including  Ayurvedic,  Unani  and
Homoeopathic medicine  but  excluding  those  specifically
mentioned in First Schedule

(1) Glands and other organs for organo therapeutic uses,
dried, whether or not powdered, extracts of glands or
other organs or of their secretions for
organo therapeutic uses, haparin and its salts, other human
or animal substances prepared for therapeutic or
prophylactic uses, not elsewhere specified or included 3001

(2) Animal  blood  prepared  for  therapeutic,  prophylactic
or diagnostic use, anitsera and other blood fractions and
modified immunological products, whether o r not
obtained by means or biotechnological processes,
vaccines, toxins, cultures of micro organisms (excluding
yeast) and similar products 3002

(3) Medicaments (excluding good of headings nos.
3002,3005 or 3006) consisting of two or more
constituents which have been mixed together for
therapeutic or prophylactic uses, not put up in measured
doses or in forms or packings for retail  sale 3003

(4) Medicaments (excluding goods of heading nos. 3002,
3005 or 3006) consisting of mixed or unmixed products
for therapeutic or prophylactic uses, put up in measured
doses (including those in the form of transdermal
administration systems) or in forms orpackings for retail
sale 3004

(1) (2) (3)



57

(5) Wadding gauze, bandages, and similar articles (for
example dressings, adhesive plasters, poultices)
impregnated  or  coated with pharmaceutical substances
or put up in forms or packings for retail sale for medical,
surgical, dental or veterinary purposes 3005

(6) other pharmaceutical goods 3006

26 Electrodes 8311.10.00

27 Embroidery or zari articles, that is to say, -imi, zari, kasab,
saima dabka, chumki, gota sitara, naqsi, kora, glass bead,
badia

Embroidery  in the piece, in strips or in mortifs

(1) Embroidery without visible ground 5810.10.00
(2) Other embroidery of cotton 5810.91.00
(3) Embroidery of man made  fibres 5810.92

(a) embroidered badges, motifs and the like 5810.92.10
(b) Other embroidered articles 5810.92.90

(4) Embroidery of other textile materials 5810.99.00
(5) Zari goods 99.91.50

28 Environment friendly recycled products as may be notified
by Government from time to time

29 Exercise book, graph book and laboratory note book

(1) Exercise book 4820.20.00
(2) Graph book, Laboratory Note book 4820.90.90

30 Ferrous and non-ferrous metals and alloys; non-metals such
as aluminium, copper, zinc and extrusions of those

(1) Pig iron and spieleleisen in pigs,blocks or other primary
forms 7201

(2) ferroalloys: Felt manganese 7202

(3) ferrous products obtained by direct reduction of iron ore
and other spongy ferrous products, in lumps, pellets or
similar forms; iron having a minimum purity by weight
of 99.94 percent, in slumps, pellets or similar forms: 7203

(1) (2) (3)



58

(4) Ferrous waste and scrap; remelting scrap ingots of iron
or steel 7204

(5) Granules and powders, of pig iron,  spiegeleisen,  iron
or steel 7205

(6) Iron and non-alloy steel in ingots or other primary forms
(excluding iron of heading 7203) 7206

(7) Semifinished products of iron or non-alloy steel:
Containing by weight less than 0.25 per cent of carbon 7207

(8) Flat-rolled products of iron  or  non-alloy  steel,  of  a
width of 600mm (23.6 inches) or more, hot-rolled, not
clad, plated or coated: 7208

(9) Flat-rolled products of iron or non-alloy steel, of a
width of 600mm (23.6 inches) or more, coled-rolled,
(cold reduced), not clad, plated or coated:  In coils, not
further worked than cold-rolled (cold reduced): 7209

(10) Flat-rolled products of iron or nonalloy steel, of a width
of 600mm (23.6 inches) or more, clad, plated or coated:
Plated or coated with tin: 7210.00

(11) Flat-rolled products of iron or nonalloy steel, of a width
of less than 600mm (23.6 inches) not clad, plated or
coated: Not furthyer worked than hot-rolled: 7211

(12) Flat-rolled products of iron or nonalloy steel, of a width
of less than 600mm (23.6 inches), clad, plated or
coated: 7212

(13) Bars and rods, hot-rolled, in irregularly wound coils,
of iron or non-alloy steel; 7213

(14) Other bars and rods of iron or non-alloy steel, not
further worked tyan forged, hot-rolled , hot-drawn or
hot-extruled, but including those twisted after rolling: 7214

(15) Other bars and rods, of iron or nonalloy steel 7215

(16) Angles, shapes and sections of iron or nonalloy steel 7216

(17) Wire of iron or nonalloy steel 7217

(1) (2) (3)


